

Hansen Mueller Co. Domestic Oat Bids

Facility	May Delivery		Jun-Aug Delivery		Jun-Aug "As-Is Test Weight"		Sept-Dec Delivery	
	Basis	Flat Price	Basis	Flat Price	Basis	Flat Price	Basis	Flat Price
Gregory, SD.	+25N	\$6.63	-40Z	\$5.45	-50Z	\$5.35	-40Z	\$5.55
Lincoln, NE.	No Bid	No Bid	-10Z	\$5.75	-20Z	\$5.65	-10Z	\$5.85
Sioux City, IA.	+45N	\$6.83	+10Z	\$5.95	+0Z	\$5.85	+10Z	\$6.05
Superior, WI.	+45N	\$6.83	+10Z	\$5.95	+0Z	\$5.85	+10Z	\$6.05
Kansas City, MO.	No Bid	No Bid	+40Z	\$6.25	+30Z	\$6.15	+40Z	\$6.35
St Ansgar, IA.	+105N	\$7.43	+60Z	\$6.45			+60Z	\$6.55

"As-Is Test Weight Bid" We will accept any test weight oats, as long as there are no other issues at a .10/bu discount to our standard 38/96 bid.

Please contact Jeremy Davenport at Hansen Mueller Co. with any questions.

Oat Contact: Jeremy Davenport

Office: 402-951-2195

Email: jeremy@hansenmueller.com